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Trimantium GrowthOps Limited announces Chief Executive appointment 
 

Trimantium GrowthOps Ltd (ASX: TGO, “GrowthOps”) announces the appointment of Paul 
Mansfield as Chief Executive Officer in addition to his role as Executive Director and Managing 
Partner, commencing tomorrow, 1 June 2018. Phillip Kingston will continue as the company’s 
Managing Director. 
 
Mr Mansfield brings deep technology expertise to GrowthOps, as well as historical experience 
in integrating multiple growth businesses. Paul was also a strategic adviser to 3wks and 
Khemistry, prior to their acquisition by GrowthOps in March 2018. 
 
Mr Mansfield has founded and exited multiple technology companies, including Weblinc 
(which sold to Cloud Sherpas in 2012) and as a foundation shareholder in Cloud Sherpas (which 
sold to Accenture in 2015), where he served as Asia Pacific Managing Director from 2012 to 
2015.  
 
Mr Mansfield was part of the executive team that listed QM Technologies on the ASX in late 
2005 (which sold to Computershare in 2008). Paul is also co-founder and Board member at 
Skedulo, a scheduling SaaS product business headquartered in San Francisco.  
 
Mr Mansfield holds a Bachelor of Commerce from the University of Wollongong.  
 
Chairman of the GrowthOps Board of Directors, Dominique Fisher said: “Paul Mansfield is a 
growth and sales-oriented CEO who understands the unique opportunities and challenges 
facing GrowthOps. He brings a disciplined, systematic approach to organic growth that will 
position the company well, both competitively and for the seamless execution of large, value-
added projects for its clients. Paul and Phillip Kingston have been working together seamlessly 
and will continue to do so.” 
 
GrowthOps Founder and Managing Director, Phillip Kingston said: “Paul has demonstrated 
exceptional leadership and management skills since he joined GrowthOps. I’m delighted to 
continue to back Paul to lead GrowthOps into the future.”  
 
Mr Mansfield said: “I am very pleased to be expanding my role with GrowthOps. Its unique 
offering across creative, technology and management consulting, combined with our talented 
and passionate staff, position the company for a bright future. The team has already shown a 
tremendous ability to collaborate to deliver growth for the company, and to help our clients 
grow.”  
 
Mr Mansfield will continue as an Executive Director on the Board of Directors of Trimantium 
GrowthOps Ltd. As Chief Executive Officer, he will report to the Chairman of the GrowthOps 
Board of Directors and also assume responsibility for the day-to-day operations of the 
company, its people and resources, including responsibility for the company financials, client 
management, and mentoring of partners and their integration with GrowthOps.  



 

 

 

 

 
In recognition of the expansion in Mr Mansfield’s responsibilities his remuneration package 
will be adjusted, consistent with market rates.  
 
Summary of Terms of Employment  
 

Commencement Date 1 June 2018 

Salary Package  

Total fixed remuneration (including Superannuation) $350,000 pa 

Short term incentives Up to $75,000 pa 

Long term incentives Up to $75,000 pa 

Termination Clauses  

Notice by Company 3 months 

Notice by Executive 3 months 

Term 3 years 

 
Phillip Kingston will continue as the company’s Managing Director on the Board of Directors of 
Trimantium GrowthOps Ltd. As Managing Director, he will also continue to be responsible for  
investor relations, delivery of growth targets, and strategic client accounts and opportunities. 
Mr Kingston’s remuneration package remains unchanged and he continues to report to the 
Chairman of the GrowthOps Board of Directors. 
 
About GrowthOps 
 
Trimantium GrowthOps Limited (ASX: TGO) is an entrepreneurial advisory and operations 
partner for organisations seeking to develop new products, services and growth strategies. We 
take ideas from concept to reality. Operating across Australia and Asia, we provide services 
spanning management consulting, technology, and advertising and creative, including: analysis 
of market threats and opportunities; leadership development; change management; cloud 
services; software development; systems integration; positioning and brand strategy; and 
marketing communications. 
 
Investor enquiries: investors@growthops.com.au 
 


