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ASX ANNOUNCEMENT 17 December 2024 

 
 

HERAMED APPOINTS HEALTHCARE TECHNOLOGY EXPERT  
VIVEK KRISHNAN TO ADVISORY BOARD 

 
                  HIGHLIGHTS 

● Vivek Krishnan, former Chief Technology Officer of Alcidion Group Limited (ASX:ALC) and current 
founder of AgiliMed, joins HeraMED's Advisory Board 

● Mr. Krishnan's expertise aligns with HeraMED's Four-Point Strategic Plan, particularly in areas of 
technology integration, data analytics, generative AI and analytics, and strategic partnerships. 

● This appointment strengthens HeraMED's position in the digital health and maternity care sectors. 

 

HeraMED Limited (ASX: HMD) (“HeraMED” or the “Company”), a medical data and technology company 
leading the digital transformation of maternity care, is pleased to announce the appointment of Vivek 
Krishnan, a seasoned healthcare technology leader, to its Advisory Board, further strengthening its 
experience and capability to support the scaling of HeraCARE.  

Mr. Krishnan, former Chief Technology Officer of Alcidion (ASX:ALC) and the founder of AgileMed, brings 
decades of deep technology and healthcare innovation experience to support HeraMED's four-point 
strategic plan for expansion and technological advancement. Mr Krishnan played a pivotal role in the 
building and scaling of Alcidion’s platform as well as managing large technology teams across Australia, 
United Kingdom and New Zealand.  

Vivek Krishnan, newly appointed Advisory Board member, commented: "I am excited to join HeraMED's 
Advisory Board at this pivotal time in the company's growth. The potential for digital transformation in 
maternity care is immense, and I look forward to contributing my expertise in health-technology, particularly 
in areas such as FHIR-based platforms, Artificial Intelligence and data analytics, to support HeraMED's 
strategic vision. The company's commitment to improving healthcare outcomes through data-driven insights 
aligns perfectly with my professional passion."  

Anoushka Gungadin, Chief Executive Officer and Managing Director, HeraMED, stated: "We are thrilled to 
welcome Vivek Krishnan to our Advisory Board. His proven track record in healthcare technology and deep 
understanding of digital health innovations will be instrumental in accelerating our four-point plan.  

Vivek’s extensive background in healthcare technology, including his leadership roles at Alcidion and 
founding of AgileMed, positions him as a valuable strategic advisor to support HeraMED's continued 
innovation and market expansion."  

The appointment is effective immediately. 

ENDS 

 
This announcement has been authorised by the CEO & Chair of HeraMED Limited. 
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About HeraMED Limited (ASX: HMD) 

HeraMED is an innovative medical data and technology company leading the digital transformation of 
maternity care by revolutionising the prenatal and postpartum experience with its hybrid maternity care 
platform. HeraMED offers a proprietary platform that utilises hardware and software to reshape the 
Doctor/Patient relationship using its clinically validated in-home foetal and maternal heart rate monitor, 
HeraBEAT, cloud computing, artificial intelligence, and big data. The Company’s proprietary offering, 
HeraCARE, has been engineered to offer a fully integrated maternal health ecosystem designed to deliver 
better care at a lower cost, ensure expectant mothers are engaged, informed and well-supported, allow 
healthcare professionals to provide the highest quality care and enable early detection and prevention of 
potential risks. 
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