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$4m contract win to deliver PICQ for the Republic of 
Ireland 
 
Beamtree Holdings Limited (“Beamtree” or “the Company” or “the Group”) (ASX: BMT), a leading 
provider of AI decision support and data insights solutions, is delighted to announce that its partnership 
with the Healthcare Pricing Office (HPO) in the Republic of Ireland has been renewed for another five 
years, with Beamtree having again been awarded the EU-wide tender to deliver PICQ® as the national 
data quality tool for public hospitals. Beamtree’s market-leading PICQ® software has been utilised by 
clinical coders in Ireland since 2018, with this new contract worth €2.3m (AU$3.95m) over five years 
and subject to the usual rights of termination for non-performance. 
  
Beamtree is a recognised global leader in audit and automation of clinical record classification – and in 
use of the Australian health classification – ICD-10-AM, which is licenced in Ireland and other European 
countries. Beamtree’s SaaS-based product PICQ® automates the audit of classification and supports 
clinical record coders improve the quality of coding data and is widely used in countries including in 
Australia, New Zealand, Kingdom of Saudi Arabia, and Canada and is under development for the UK. 
  
Marek Stepniak, Beamtree’s CEO, said ‘We are proud of this important recognition of the value of 
PICQ from one of longstanding national customers. It is our great privilege to continue to support the 
HPO as they work to deliver coding excellence for the Republic of Ireland. Our proven expertise in 
clinical record classification and audit together with our PICQ® and automated coding software, assist 
health services in improving the quality, reliability and use of data to create a learning health system 
and deliver better outcomes for patients.’ 
 
Authorised for release by the Chair of the Board. 
 
For further information, please email investor@beamtree.com.au 
 
-ENDS-   
 
About Beamtree 
A leading provider of AI decision support and data insights solutions, Beamtree supports healthcare 
providers globally. They believe in creating a better future for health by turning data into insights and 
action through automation. They help solve real-world problems in healthcare by developing smart 
tools that aim to improve patient outcomes. Their solutions and services offer customers an unrivalled 
range of analytics across four key product segments:  

• Diagnostic Technology: Enabling the effective delivery of diagnostic services as they underpin 

the future of health and personalised medicine. 

• Clinical Decision Support: Combining human and artificial expertise together to enhance 

decisions that improve care, value and experience. 

• Coding Assistance and Data Quality: Digitising and automating workflows with data, 

classification, coding & technical expertise to improve information standardisation, quality and 

timeliness. 

• Analytics and Knowledge Networks: Combining data analytics solutions with peer-to-peer 

alliances that accelerate innovation and knowledge diffusion. 
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