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Additional MESMER™ Sales & Update 
 

 
PERTH, WA and COLUMBIA, MD USA – DEPARTMENT 13 INTERNATIONAL LTD (ASX: D13) 
(“Department 13”, “D13” or “the Company”) a cutting-edge developer of counter drone technology, is 
pleased to provide this update on the ongoing sales of its MESMER™ units. 
 
As part of its ongoing sales program, D13 can confirm that it is continuing to grow its sales with the recent 
sales of a further 2 MESMERTM units in December 2017 to clients in Australia and South East Asia, with 
shipping of the units sold expected to be completed by January 2018. 
 
The units sold are the MESMERTM v1.0 and MESMERTM v1.5 units, and although the sale terms are 
commercially confidential, D13 has previously announced that the v1.5 unit sells for up to US$400,000 
per unit, including licensing fees. 
 
Department 13 CEO, Jonathan Hunter, commented: “The use of MESMER™ as a solution to protect 
airspace over  critical infrastructure is yet another key global market to D13. The Company is confident 
the ongoing sales and the successful implementation of MESMER™ will provide a reference of the 
product’s capabilities to other authorities who are ultimately responsible for critical infrastructure. 
Importantly, D13 takes confidence that we are seeing are return customers. We continue to undertake 
demonstrations with customers globally, within the defense, critical infrastructure and commercial 
industries. The Company expects to be able to announce this calendar year a working capital facility that 
will enable the Company to begin building up its inventory in expectation of future sales.”  
 
In addition, further to the Company response to ASX on 29 November 2017, D13 advises that it has 
signed a non-binding terms sheet for a working capital facility with a suitably qualified lender, and 
anticipates confirming to ASX the execution of the binding facility agreement prior to the end of 2017. The 
working capital facility will be used to meet the Company’s ongoing working capital requirements as it 
continues to build sales of its products. D13 will provide a further update, including all required details of 
the facility once final binding terms are signed. 
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About Department 13  
 
Based in Maryland, Department 13 (D13) was founded in 2010 by a team of former military operators, 
scientists and engineers who apply proprietary innovative advanced technology to emerging requirements. 
D13 is developing cutting-edge software and communication systems that have the potential to transform 
the networking and communication fields as well as current applications in drone defense, mobile phone 
IT security and secure enhanced Android phone systems. D13 is engaged with multiple counter UAS 
projects to provide strategic solutions for civil, military and commercial security requirements. D13 has 19 
patents and 29 patent applications in the development of wireless protocol manipulation and 
communication networking software with applications in drone defense, local area and wide area cellular 
communications and networking, enhanced data bandwidth for all digital communications, cyber security 
for mobile devices and sophisticated RF technology applications (radiometrics). For more information 
about D13, please visit www.department13.com or follow us on Twitter (@D13ASX), LinkedIn and 
YouTube. 
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