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Monday 22 September 2014 
 
Urbanise expands education customer base with Chicago agreement  
 
Urbanise.com Limited (Urbanise) (ASX:UBN) announced today that it had entered 
into a hosted services agreement with Chicago Maintenance & Construction LLC 
(Chicago) – facility manager to the world’s largest private education provider. Under 
the agreement, Chicago plans to rollout the Urbanise platform across its entire 
portfolio. 

Urbanise CEO Ben Churchill said, “Chicago's portfolio includes more than 50 GEMS 
schools throughout the UAE. Chicago Home also provides home maintenance and 
lifestyle services to thousands of teachers working in these schools. As a vertically 
integrated provider that also manufactures and supplies furniture and joinery, 
working with Chicago provides us with the opportunity to facilitate product supply to 
schools, homes and businesses using the Urbanise platform.” 
 
Chicago Chief Operating Officer Craig Adams said he has not seen technology that 
meets the requirements of the business and its clients as well as the Urbanise 
platform.  
 
“Understanding the needs of our clients has always been Chicago’s priority. 
Transforming how we communicate with our clients to better meet those needs is 
what Urbanise allows us to do. In partnership with Urbanise, we have been able to 
bring together our complete operations and customer journey in a single platform to 
considerably improve on efficiency, delivery, transparency and customer care. This 
has given us a unique selling point for both existing and new customers.”  
 
About Chicago 
Established in 1978, Chicago has grown to be a diverse company within the FM, 
Interiors, Trading and Construction industries. Chicago has offices throughout the 
UAE, Oman and Qatar. Their FM services offer the Total Facilities Management 
solution for Commercial, Retail, Education and Home sectors and are sister 
company and service provider to GEMS Education, the World's largest private 
education provider. www.chicago.ae 
 
About Urbanise 
Urbanise is the creator of a cloud-based platform for delivering building services. 
Designed for the Facility Management Industry, the software-as-a-service platform 
is transforming the traditional engineering approach to building operations – 
improving customer service, removing operational costs and enabling new revenue 
streams. Urbanise technology is used into some of the tallest towers and most 
prestigious communities around the globe. www.urbanise.com 
 
For further information contact: Lauren Thompson +61 438 954 729 

 


