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NuSep Holdings Limited (ASX:NSP) has announced today that it has entered into an Enforceable 
Undertaking with the Australian Securities and Investments Commission relating to potential 
contraventions of the Corporations Act 2001 (Cth) (Corporations Act) between 2009 and 2012.  The 
Undertaking will be available to be reviewed on a public register maintained by ASIC. 

Over the course of last year, the Australian Securities and Investments Commission (ASIC) has 
conducted an investigation of suspected contraventions of the Corporations Act by NuSep prior to 2012.  

As a consequence of this investigation, NuSep has today signed an Enforceable Undertaking (“the 
Undertaking”) with ASIC which binds the Company to a standard of Governance and compliance with 
certain conditions set out in the Undertaking. A copy of the Undertaking is provided with this 
announcement and will also be published on NuSep’s website. 

ASIC has outlined its concerns in the Undertaking including but not limited to the possibility that NuSep 
may have contravened a number of sections of the Corporations Act. In particular, ASIC has concerns that 
NuSep may have breached its continuous disclosure obligations by failing to disclose information that was 
required to be disclosed and by releasing inaccurate information. In addition, , ASIC has concerns that 
NuSep may have contravened a section in the Act which prohibits a company from acquiring shares in 
itself by issuing and holding shares in a suspense account. ASIC has also had concerns over NuSep’s 
standards of record keeping, the issuing of bonuses to former executives and a range other suspected 
breaches of the Corporations Act outlined in the Undertaking. 

NuSep has acknowledged ASIC's concerns and that they are reasonably held. Additionally, the 
Undertaking notes specifically that the conduct took place prior to 2012 and the appointment of the current 
board. In the course of the period after the matters under investigation there have been significant change 
to the composition of the Board of Directors of NuSep. This followed the resignation of the Executive 
Chairman and Managing Director in November 2013 and the appointment of new directors. 

ASIC has acknowledged the co-operation and assistance of NuSep and its current officers in relation to 
the Undertaking. ASIC has also acknowledged the action NuSep has already taken to address a number 
of ASIC's concerns, including the change of directors and company secretary. Additionally, ASIC has 
acknowledged NuSep's co-operation in that it has assisted the investigation by withdrawing legal 
professional privilege claims. 

NuSep has offered the undertakings and ASIC has agreed to accept those undertakings as an alternative 
to commencing civil proceedings against NuSep.  

As part of the undertakings, NuSep has agreed to continue the procedures which it has implemented and 
to adopt and publish an executive remuneration policy consistent with the ASX Corporate Governance 
Principles and Recommendations including cancellation and clawback of performance based executive 
remuneration. The policy will be disclosed on NuSep's website which is currently being redeveloped. 
NuSep has also agreed that it will ensure, to the extent possible, that its subsidiaries also comply with the 
Undertaking, by providing the subsidiaries with written notices about the practices and procedures that are 
required to be adopted.  
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NuSep has undertaken to appoint an independent Compliance Expert to review and report to ASIC on 
NuSep’s corporate governance procedures within 30 days from the date of this Undertaking. The review 
period will extend for three years from the date of signing of the Undertaking. 
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Alison Coutts 
Executive Chairman 
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